
Privacy Policy

Kansas Legal Services is committed to protecting your privacy and safeguarding any personal
information shared with us. This Privacy Policy outlines how we collect, use, and protect the
information provided through our website and other communication channels.

Information Collection

We collect only the necessary information to provide our legal services and to communicate with
you effectively. This may include your name, phone number, email address, and other contact
information. We do not sell, rent, or share your information with third parties.

Kansas Legal Services uses tools, including Google Analytics, to collect web traffic data and
other statistics to monitor and improve the performance of our website. Google Analytics
collects information such as device details, browser type, IP address (which may be
anonymized), and user interactions on the site (e.g., pages visited, links clicked). This data
helps us understand how users engage with our website, which pages are of most interest, and
to enhance the user experience. The data collected is not linked to personally identifiable
information.

The website uses "cookies," which are small text files placed on your computer's hard drive.
These cookies help us track web traffic and monitor user behavior, such as the number of visits
to various pages. Cookies related to Google Analytics may collect additional information such as
device information, geographic location, and browsing patterns. You may disable cookies
through your web browser settings, though this may affect the functionality of certain website
features. Kansas Legal Services uses cookies only to remember login names for registered
users and to track website performance through analytics. We do not use cookies to collect any
unrelated information.

While Kansas Legal Services does not share your personal information with third parties,
Google, as a service provider, may have access to some of the anonymized or aggregated data
collected through Google Analytics. We cannot guarantee that third parties will not circumvent
our security measures, potentially resulting in a data breach. However, we take reasonable
precautions to protect your information.

How We Use Your Information

The information collected is used exclusively to provide legal services, answer your inquiries,
and keep you updated about relevant information regarding our services. We do not share your
information with third parties, except as required by law or as part of providing our services.

Your Choices



You have the right to request access, correction, or deletion of your personal information at any
time. If you have concerns or questions regarding the use of your information, please contact
us.

Opt-in and Opt-out Choices

By submitting your information, you consent to receive communications from us via email,
phone, or SMS text messaging regarding legal services and updates. You may opt out of
receiving text messages at any time by replying STOP to any text message or by contacting us
directly.

Messaging and Data Rates

Message and data rates may apply to any SMS or text communications you receive from us.
For additional assistance or to stop receiving messages, you may reply HELP or contact us
directly.

Links

This website contains links to other websites that we believe may benefit you. Kansas Legal
Services is not responsible for the information collection and dissemination practices of the
websites linked on our page. Please use discretion when providing personal information to the
other websites linked on our page.

Policy Changes

This Privacy Policy may be updated from time to time. We will notify you of any significant
changes by posting an updated version on our website. Your continued use of our services
implies acceptance of these changes.

Contact Information

For any questions or concerns regarding this Privacy Policy, please contact us at (785)
233-2068.


